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Amy Ow

From: Camille Leung
Sent: Friday, August 23, 2019 3:18 PM
To: melissa@leet.com
Cc: Amy Ow
Subject: FW: Lots 9-11 Highlands

Hi Melissa, 
 
Please see below for the email I sent to your dad regarding remaining items for Lots 9‐11.   
 

From: Camille Leung  
Sent: Friday, August 23, 2019 1:47 PM 
To: Paula Vraast‐Thomsen <pthomsen@smcgov.org>; Jack Chamberlain <jtuttlec@aol.com> 
Cc: 'Noel Chamberlain' <noel@nexgenbuilders.com>; Amy Ow <aow@smcgov.org> 
Subject: RE: Lots 9‐11 Highlands 

 
Hi Jack, 
 
Permits are not ready to pick up.  Noel knows what we need, which includes a grading schedule, mitigation monitoring 
contract fees, and completion of erosion control measures for Lots 9 and 10.  Lot 11 has additional requirements.     
 
Thanks 
 

From: Paula Vraast‐Thomsen  
Sent: Friday, August 23, 2019 1:43 PM 
To: Jack Chamberlain <jtuttlec@aol.com> 
Cc: Camille Leung <cleung@smcgov.org> 
Subject: FW: Lots 9‐11 Highlands 

 
Hi Jack, 
I sent to Camille……. 
 
From: Jack Chamberlain [mailto:jtuttlec@aol.com]  
Sent: Friday, August 23, 2019 1:09 PM 
To: Paula Vraast‐Thomsen <pthomsen@smcgov.org> 
Subject: Lots 9‐11 Highlands 

 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of San Mateo County. Unless you recognize the sender's email address and know 

the content is safe, do not click links, open attachments or reply. 
 

Paula, 
 
Are you in?  If not, will you be 8 to 8:30 Monday Morning? 
 
I want to pay for the building permit fees. 
 
Jack 


